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The nights at the round table: Fred *ess's lnner Circle'

familv members from across three
seneiations are a red-and-blue
ioncertinaed portrait ga[ery on stark
white shelves. Lee's trademark
multiple photocopying of each face
creat6s subtlv different features, while
splashes of biack paint resembling
tfrick sprays of bitumen narrowly miss
her subieits. On naro other walls
ohotograPher, social essaYist and
third-gen-eration Chinese Australian
Wilialn Yang presents two arms of his
family. One, About MY Mother, is a
tenderly revealing homage to a
complex yet loving relationshiP.

18L-187 HaY Steet, citY'
9212 0380. TuesdaY to SaturdaY
L1am-6pm, until October 18.

PORTIA GEACH MEMORIAL
AWARD
S.H. Ervin GallerY
The Portia Geach, the annual award
for portraiture bY contemPorarY
Australian women artists, is now
nearly 4O years old. This year veteran

painter Wendy SharPe won the
'$f S,OOo pize for Self-Poftait with
Teacup and Buming Paintings, a
chud& brew of form, fervour and
self-scrutiny. And, among the 60
paintings seleaed for exhibition, it's a
iimilatitory. Margarita Georgiadis's
intention to reveal "a creative and
psvchological breakthrough" has
ieiuttea ir a self-portrait ofsurging
motion and fleeting disclosure.
Georgiadis's head is tilted back, her
hps ale slashes of red, while her
steady gaze is both guarded and
vulnerable. Melissa Beowulf 's nervy'
self-portrait, which was highlY
commended by the judges, features-
the artist eyeing theviewer as a half-
finished canvas. With Paintbrush
poised and slashes of white light '
ioating her ruddy skin and red hair,
Beowulf seems Possessed.

National Trust Centte, Watson
Road, Observatory HilL, The Rocks,
9258 0L23. TuesdaY to FtidaY
11am-Spm, SaturdaY and SundaY
noon-Spm, until November 2.
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